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Opinion

CIVIL MINUTES - GENERAL

Proceedings: In Chambers RE DEFENDANT'S 
MOTION TO COMPEL FURTHER DEPOSITIONS OF 
HARVEY GELLER AND CHIPO SACHIRARWE 

KNIGGE

On July 21, 2008, Defendant American Home 
Assurance Company (AHAC) filed a motion to compel 
further depositions of Harvey Geller and Chipo 
Sachirarwe Knigge, along with a joint stipulation 
pursuant to Local Rule 37. Mr. Geller was deposed as a 
fact witness on May 1, 2008, and Ms. Knigge was 
deposed as a Fed. R. Civ. P. 30(b)(6) witness on May 9, 
2008.

This matter is appropriate [*2]  for adjudication without 
oral argument. Fed. R. Civ. P. 78; Local Rule 7-15.

The discovery cut-off date in this matter is August 14, 
2008. (Docket No. 83.) The Court's Scheduling and 
Case Management Order requires that "[a]ny motion 
challenging the adequacy of responses to discovery 
must be filed timely, served and calendared sufficiently 
in advance of the discovery cut-off date to permit the 
responses to be obtained before that date, if the motion 
is granted."

AHAC's motion to compel was filed on July 21, 2008, 
and noticed for hearing on August 12, 2008, two days 
before the discovery cut-off date. AHAC's motion is not 
calendared sufficiently in advance of the discovery cut-
off date to permit the depositions to be completed 
before the discovery cutoff date even if the motion is 
granted.

Accordingly, IT IS HEREBY ORDERED that AHAC's 
motion to compel further depositions of Harvey Geller 
and Chipo Sachirarwe Knigge is DENIED. The August 
12, 2008 hearing date is hereby vacated.
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